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authored by Lydia Richardson with David Smith and Charlotte Blundy of TripleLine, in October 2015. A
pdf copy is available

As this report points out, Challenge Funds are common means of funding development aid
projects but they have not received the evaluation attention they deserve.  In this TripleLine study
the authors collated information 56 such funds. .â?•One of the key findings was that of the 56 funds,
only 11 (19.6%) had a document entitled â??impact assessment?, of these 7 have been published.
Looking through these, only one (Chars Livelihood Programme) appears to be close to DFID?s
definition of impact evaluation, although this programme is not considered to be a true challenge fund
according to the definition outlined in the introduction. The others assess impact but do not necessarily
fit DFID?s 2015 definition of impact evaluationâ?•

Also noted later in the text:â?¦ â??An email request for information on evaluation of challenge funds
was sent to fund and evaluation managers. This resulted in just two responses from 11 different
organisations. This verifies the finding that there is very little evaluation of challenge funds available
in the public domainâ?•â?¦.â?•Evaluation was in most cases not incorporated into the fundâ??s
designâ?•.

â??This brief report focuses on the extent to which challenge funds are evaluable. It unpacks
definitions of the core terms used and provides some analysis and guidance for those commissioning
evaluations. The guidance is also relevant for those involved in designing and managing challenge
funds to make them more evaluableâ?•
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Rick Davies Comment: .While projects funded by Challenge Funds are often evaluated, sometimes as
a requirement of their funding, it seems that the project selection and funding process itself is is not
given the same level of scrutiny. By this I mean the process whereby candidate projects are screened,
assessed and then chosen or not, for funding. This process involves consideration of multiple criteria,
including adherence to legal requirements, strategic alignment and grantees capacity to implement
activities and achieve objectives. This is where the Challenge Fund Theory of Change actually gets
operationalised. It should be possible to test the (tacit and explicit) theory being implemented at this
point  by gathering data on the subsequent performance of the funded projects. There should be some
form of consistent association between attributes of highly rated project proposals (versus lowly rated
proposals) and the scale of their achievements when implemented. If there is not, then it suggests that
the proposal screening process is not delivering value and that random choice would be cheaper and
just as effective. One experience I have had of this kind of analysis was not very encouraging. We
could not find any form of consistent association between project attributes noted during project
selection and the scale of subsequent achievement. But perhaps with more comprehensive recording
of data collected at the project assessment stage the analysis might have delivered more encouraging
resultsâ?¦

PS: This report was done using 14 person days, which is a tight budget given the time need to collate
data, let alone analyse it. A good report, especially considering these time constraints
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